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Khadesh Global Integrated
Services Limited is a dynamic
export driven company based in
Nigeria, specializing in the supply
of high quality agricultural
commodities , solid minerals and
offering project management
services for renewable energy
and sustainability-focused
initiatives. Our mission is to
contribute to Nigeria’s economic
growth by bridging the gap
between local producers and
international markets while
promoting sustainable
development.Khadesh Global
Integrated Services Limited is a
leading exporter of premium
Nigerian agricultural products
and solid minerals, catering to
global markets with high-quality,
ethically sourced goods.
Headquartered in Abuja, Nigeria,
we specialize in exporting raw
shea butter, dried hibiscus
flowers, dried ginger, cashew
nuts, soya beans, tin ore, lithium
ore, copper ore, and zinc ore. 
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https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/dried-hibiscus-flower
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/raw-shea-butter
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/raw-cashew-nuts
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/tin-ore
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/copper-ore
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/lithium-ore
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/zinc-ore
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/dried-ginger
https://khadeshglobal.co.uk/product/soya-beans
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khadeshglobalintegratedservice
@gmail.com

21 Ndjamena Crescent, Wuse
2, Abuja, Nigeria
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